



SOLICITATION #

601440000012797

Bid Opening Date:

7/14/2017

TITLE

Backhoe to include attachments

VENDOR	UNIT PRICE									
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
Associated Supply Company	\$113,109.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$93,581.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	No Bid	\$100,241.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$116,610.96	\$116,610.96	\$115,057.60	\$116,610.96		
Nueces Power Equipment	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	\$148,020.19	\$123,595.09	\$131,980.51	\$122,501.34	\$148,332.69	\$148,332.69	\$146,978.52	\$148,332.69		
	RDO Equipment Company	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19
Line 21		Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31		Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
Line 1		Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
\$170,694.98		\$152,257.74	\$162,914.12	\$151,073.70	\$172,724.76	\$172,724.76	\$169,567.32	\$171,033.28		
The Akana Group		Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40

No outside (non-TxDOT) visitors present at the bid opening

Outside visitors present. Sign-in sheet has been created

To create a new page: copy all cells (except Header & Footer) on page 1 and insert into new page.

NOTE: Create new pages BEFORE entering data.



SOLICITATION #

601440000012797

Bid Opening Date:

7/14/2017

TITLE

Backhoe to include attachments

VENDOR	UNIT PRICE									
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40



SOLICITATION #
TITLE

601440000012797

Bid Opening Date:

7/14/2017

Backhoe to include attachments

VENDOR	UNIT PRICE									
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40

No outside (non-TxDOT) visitors present at the bid opening

Outside visitors present. Sign-in sheet has been created