



Bid Opening Date: 04/06/09

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B052009012886000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Johnson Bros Oil Co.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	1.4412	1.8444	1.4712	1.8344	1.4912	1.8644	1.5212	1.9044	1.5712	1.9344
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	1.4612	1.8444	1.4712	1.8544	1.4812	1.8644	1.4962	1.8644	1.4512	1.8344
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	1.4412	1.8444	1.5012	1.9044	1.5712	1.9544	1.5212	1.9144	1.4712	1.8644
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
1.5712	1.9444	1.5012	1.9044	1.5312	1.9144	1.4912	1.8544			
Petroleum Traders Corp.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	1.4099	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	1.4446	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	1.4015	No bid
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
No bid	No bid	1.4207	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid			
Gold Star Petroleum Inc.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	1.5141	1.8773	1.4587	1.8219	1.4465	1.8130	1.5212	1.8844	1.4587	1.8219
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	1.4590	1.8222	1.4287	1.7919	1.3907	1.7572	1.4683	1.8315	1.4312	1.7944
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	1.4084	1.7716	1.5507	1.9139	1.4824	1.8456	1.5221	1.8853	1.3930	1.7562
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
1.4691	1.8323	1.4110	1.7781	1.4048	1.7680	1.4262	1.7894			
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	