



Bid Opening Date: 07/14/08

## Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B082008041897000

Vendor	Unit Price									
<b>Gold Star Petroleum, Inc.</b>	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	<b>3.9314</b>	<b>4.2497</b>	<b>4.0132</b>	<b>4.3315</b>	<b>3.8502</b>	<b>4.1685</b>	<b>3.6842</b>	<b>4.0025</b>	<b>3.7969</b>	<b>4.1152</b>
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	<b>3.8134</b>	<b>4.1317</b>	<b>3.8058</b>	<b>4.1241</b>	<b>4.2723</b>	<b>4.5906</b>	<b>4.2698</b>	<b>4.5881</b>	<b>4.0080</b>	<b>4.3263</b>
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
<b>4.4649</b>	<b>4.7812</b>	<b>4.5249</b>	<b>4.8432</b>	<b>3.7092</b>	<b>4.0275</b>					
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
<b>Brown County MKT.</b>	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.4902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.8902</b>	<b>4.5770</b>	<b>4.2902</b>					
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
<b>Petroleum Traders Corporation</b>	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>3.6513</b>	<b>3.9834</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>3.7613</b>	<b>4.0782</b>					
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	

\* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).