g Bid Opening Date: 05/29/08

Texas
ChDarTimhesr - H H - -
er,m Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B102008026105000
Vendor Unit Price
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
No bid 3.4595 No bid No bid No bid 3.4595 No bid No bid 3.4595 3.4595
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
- . 3.4595
Williams Qil Co. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
No bid No bid 3.6210 3.6077 No bid 3.5854 3.6533 No bid No bid No bid
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
3.5830
Petroleum Traders Inc. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
3.5545 3.5845 3.5345 3.5545 3.5845 3.5645 3.5545 3.5545 3.5845 3.5845
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
. 3.5545
Johnson Bros Oil Company Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
3.5322 3.5537 3.4500 3.4652 3.5631 3.4346 3.4752 3.5620 3.5307 3.5305
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
3.4375
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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