



Bid Opening Date: 11/12/08

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B142009004143000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Johnson Bros. Oil Co.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	2.0537	2.4212	2.0937	2.4412	2.0337	2.4212	2.0637	2.4512	2.0337	2.4012
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	2.0637	2.4412	2.0737	2.4512	2.0337	2.4012	2.0737	2.4512	2.0337	2.4112
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	2.0237	2.4112	2.0737	2.4512	2.0537	2.4112	2.0437	2.4312	2.0437	2.4012
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
2.0537	2.4412	2.0337	2.4112							
Petroleum Traders Corp.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.3944	1.9786	2.3551	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.4321
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.9894	2.3770	No Bid	No Bid	2.0037	2.3756
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	1.9637	2.3537	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.3982	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.3549
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
No Bid	No Bid	1.9865	No Bid							
Triple S Petroleum	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	1.957	2.3445	2.0437	2.4312	2.0437	2.4312	1.9496	2.3371	2.1962	2.5837
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	1.9496	2.3371	2.0937	2.4812	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.9632	2.3507
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	1.9436	2.3311	1.9436	2.3311	1.9436	2.3311	1.9732	2.3607	1.9926	2.3801
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
1.9926	2.3807	1.9732	2.3607							
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	2.0538	2.4472	1.9752	2.3686	1.9627	2.3413	2.0413	2.4347	1.9746	2.3680
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	2.0560	2.4494	2.0970	2.4904	1.9634	2.3568	1.9807	2.3741	1.9319	2.3253
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	1.9383	2.3317	2.0441	2.4375	2.0556	2.3978	1.9877	2.3811	1.9501	2.3435
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
2.1464	2.6280	1.9482	2.3416							

* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).



Bid Opening Date: 11/12/08

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B142009004143000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Sun Coast Resources	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	2.0437	2.4312	2.0737	2.4512	2.0637	2.4312	2.0887	2.4512	2.1037	2.4712
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	2.1927	2.4772	2.1437	2.4412	2.0687	2.4562	2.0887	2.4762	2.0287	2.4162
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	2.0287	2.4112	2.0887	2.4562	2.0587	2.4162	2.0587	2.4612	2.0737	2.4262
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
2.0637	2.4812	2.0287	2.4312							
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	

* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).