



Bid Opening Date: 06/11/2008

### Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B242008036744000

Vendor	Unit Price									
<b>Petroleum Traders Corporation</b>	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>3.5766</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>3.5245</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>						
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
<b>Gold Star Petroleum, Inc.</b>	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	<b>3.4591</b>	<b>3.4590</b>	<b>3.5497</b>	<b>3.4580</b>	<b>3.6372</b>	<b>3.5665</b>	<b>3.6530</b>	<b>3.6945</b>	<b>3.6174</b>	<b>3.6185</b>
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	<b>3.5864</b>	<b>3.6966</b>	<b>3.6975</b>	<b>3.7015</b>						
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40

\* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).