



Bid Opening Date: 10/11/2010

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B332011003265000

| Vendor | Unit Price | | | | | | | | | |
|---|------------|---------|---------|---------|---------|---------|---------|---------|---------|---------|
| | Line 1 | Line 2 | Line 3 | Line 4 | Line 5 | Line 6 | Line 7 | Line 8 | Line 9 | Line 10 |
| e-DOCUMENT SERVICES 1430 YALE ST. HOUSTON, TX 77008 | \$0.25 | \$0.05 | \$0.18 | \$0.36 | \$0.45 | \$0.45 | \$0.04 | \$0.25 | \$0.04 | \$0.08 |
| | Line 11 | Line 12 | Line 13 | Line 14 | Line 15 | Line 16 | Line 17 | Line 18 | Line 19 | Line 20 |
| | \$0.40 | \$0.80 | \$4.75 | \$0.70 | \$10.00 | \$2.00 | \$8.00 | \$0.005 | \$0.05 | \$1.00 |
| | Line 21 | Line 22 | Line 23 | Line 24 | Line 25 | Line 26 | Line 27 | Line 28 | Line 29 | Line 30 |
| | \$1.00 | \$0.75 | \$0.75 | \$0.75 | \$1.00 | \$1.00 | \$1.25 | \$1.25 | \$1.25 | \$1.50 |
| | Line 31 | Line 32 | Line 33 | Line 34 | Line 35 | Line 36 | Line 37 | Line 38 | Line 39 | Line 40 |
| | \$1.50 | \$0.05 | \$0.05 | \$0.05 | \$0.50 | \$0.30 | \$0.09 | \$0.05 | \$0.05 | \$1.00 |
| | Line 41 | | | | | | | | | |
| \$1.00 | | | | | | | | | | |
| GURROLA REPROGRAPHICS 6161 WASHINGTON AVE. HOUSTON, TX 77007 | \$0.04 | \$0.07 | \$0.30 | \$0.50 | \$1.00 | \$2.00 | \$0.06 | \$0.35 | \$0.07 | \$0.11 |
| | Line 11 | Line 12 | Line 13 | Line 14 | Line 15 | Line 16 | Line 17 | Line 18 | Line 19 | Line 20 |
| | \$0.55 | \$1.00 | \$0.39 | \$0.78 | \$12.00 | \$0.78 | \$12.00 | \$0.10 | \$0.10 | \$0.90 |
| | Line 21 | Line 22 | Line 23 | Line 24 | Line 25 | Line 26 | Line 27 | Line 28 | Line 29 | Line 30 |
| | \$0.99 | \$1.25 | \$1.50 | \$1.50 | \$1.50 | \$1.50 | \$1.50 | \$1.50 | \$1.50 | \$1.50 |
| | Line 31 | Line 32 | Line 33 | Line 34 | Line 35 | Line 36 | Line 37 | Line 38 | Line 39 | Line 40 |
| | \$1.50 | \$0.05 | \$0.05 | \$0.05 | \$10.00 | \$0.50 | \$0.09 | \$0.05 | \$0.05 | \$1.00 |
| | Line 41 | | | | | | | | | |
| \$1.00 | | | | | | | | | | |
| COPY DR., INC. 3814 BISSONNET HOUSTON, TX 77005 | \$0.02 | \$0.055 | \$0.29 | \$0.39 | \$0.75 | \$1.19 | \$0.06 | \$0.39 | \$0.04 | \$0.10 |
| | Line 11 | Line 12 | Line 13 | Line 14 | Line 15 | Line 16 | Line 17 | Line 18 | Line 19 | Line 20 |
| | \$0.58 | \$1.19 | \$15.00 | \$1.09 | \$25.50 | \$1.79 | \$30.00 | \$0.20 | \$0.20 | \$1.49 |
| | Line 21 | Line 22 | Line 23 | Line 24 | Line 25 | Line 26 | Line 27 | Line 28 | Line 29 | Line 30 |
| | \$0.79 | \$2.25 | \$2.25 | \$2.25 | \$2.25 | \$2.25 | \$2.25 | \$3.25 | \$3.50 | \$3.50 |
| | Line 31 | Line 32 | Line 33 | Line 34 | Line 35 | Line 36 | Line 37 | Line 38 | Line 39 | Line 40 |
| | \$3.50 | \$0.25 | \$0.02 | \$0.02 | \$0.01 | \$1.00 | \$0.32 | \$0.02 | \$0.02 | \$1.00 |
| | Line 41 | | | | | | | | | |
| \$1.00 | | | | | | | | | | |



Bid Opening Date: 10/11/2010

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B332011003265000

| Vendor | Unit Price | | | | | | | | | |
|--|---------------|---------------|---------------|---------------|----------------|---------------|---------------|---------------|---------------|---------------|
| REGION 4 SERVICE EDUCATION CENTER 7145 W. TIDWELL HOUSTON, TX 77092 | Line 1 | Line 2 | Line 3 | Line 4 | Line 5 | Line 6 | Line 7 | Line 8 | Line 9 | Line 10 |
| | \$.02 | \$.033 | \$.162 | \$.031 | \$.2156 | \$.38 | \$.025 | \$.24 | \$.037 | \$.042 |
| | Line 11 | Line 12 | Line 13 | Line 14 | Line 15 | Line 16 | Line 17 | Line 18 | Line 19 | Line 20 |
| | \$.22 | \$.37 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$.012 | \$.012 | No Bid |
| | Line 21 | Line 22 | Line 23 | Line 24 | Line 25 | Line 26 | Line 27 | Line 28 | Line 29 | Line 30 |
| | No Bid | \$.50 | \$.69 | \$.76 | \$.86 | \$.95 | \$1.01 | \$1.25 | \$1.39 | \$1.63 |
| | Line 31 | Line 32 | Line 33 | Line 34 | Line 35 | Line 36 | Line 37 | Line 38 | Line 39 | Line 40 |
| | \$1.78 | | | | | | | | | |
| Line 41 | \$.09 | \$.09 | \$.07 | \$.002 | No Bid | No Bid | \$.07 | \$.07 | \$1.00 | |
| \$1.00 | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | |