



Bid Opening Date: 02/04/2009

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B442009014817000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Briggs Equipment	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	65.00	399.00	78.00	423.00	65.00	399.00	65.00	399.00	65.00	390.00
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	65.00	399.00	124.00	537.00	198.00	637.00	69.00	407.00	NON BID ITEM	88.50/75.00
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	NON BID ITEM	72.00/62.00	NON BID ITEM	88.50/75.00						
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
Houston Industrial Life Inc	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	No Bid									
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
Stewart & Stevenson	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	83.03	800.00	83.03	800.00	83.03	800.00	83.03	800.00	83.03	800.00
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	83.03	800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NON BID ITEM	75.00
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	.55	0.00	NON BID ITEM	75.00						
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
Equipment Depot, LTD.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	47.00	68.00	47.00	68.00	47.00	68.00	47.00	68.00	47.00	68.00
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	47.00	68.00	55.00	76.00	NO BID	NO BID	47.00	68.00	NON BID ITEM	70.00
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	0.00	42.00	NON BID ITEM	42.00						
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	



Bid Opening Date: 02/04/2009

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B442009014817000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Shoppa's Material Handling	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	55.00	170.00	N/A	N/A	NON BID ITEM	75.00
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	NON BID ITEM	75.00	NON BID ITEM	75.00						
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40

* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).

